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Cookie Policy 

WHITEGATE PRO LTD ("Company", "we", "us", or "our") uses cookies on its website 
https://whitegate.io (“Site”). By using the Site, you consent to the use of cookies in accordance 
with this Cookie Policy. 

 

1. Introduction 

To enhance your experience on our Site and provide you with tailored services, we use cookies 
and similar tracking technologies. This Cookie Policy outlines how and why we use these 
technologies and the choices you have. 

Cookies are small, often encrypted text files that are stored on your device when you visit a 
website. They help websites remember your actions and preferences (such as login details or 
language) so you don’t have to re-enter them each time you visit. Some cookies are session-based 
and are deleted once you close your browser. Others are persistent and remain stored on your 
device until they expire or are manually deleted. 

We use cookies only based on your explicit consent. If you continue to browse the Site, you are 
agreeing to our use of cookies as described herein. 

Most browsers automatically accept cookies, but you can modify your browser settings to decline 
cookies if you prefer. However, disabling cookies may affect your ability to use certain features 
on the Site. 

We use both first-party cookies (set by us) and third-party cookies (set by third-party services) to 
optimize our platform, improve analytics, and provide a more personalized user experience. 

 

2. Types of Cookies We Use 

Cookies on our Site fall into the following categories: 

(a) Essential Cookies: These cookies are required for the Site to function correctly. They enable 
core functionalities such as page navigation, secure areas, and account authentication. 
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(b) Analytical/Performance Cookies: These cookies collect information about how users interact 
with our Site. We use tools like Google Analytics to assess page visits, time spent on pages, and 
traffic sources, allowing us to improve website performance. 

(c) Functionality Cookies: These cookies remember your choices (such as language preferences 
or login credentials) to provide you with enhanced and more personalized features. 

(d) Targeting/Advertising Cookies: These cookies are used to deliver advertising that is more 
relevant to your interests. They can also limit the number of times you see an ad and help measure 
the effectiveness of advertising campaigns. 

 

3. Security and External Links 

The cookies we use are safe and do not compromise your security. In many cases, they are essential 
to protect your data and facilitate secure sessions. 

If you navigate to third-party websites via links on our Site, please note that they have their own 
privacy and cookie policies. WHITEGATE PRO LTD is not responsible for the content or privacy 
practices of external websites. 

 

4. Managing Cookies 

Most web browsers automatically accept cookies by default. However, you can usually modify 
your browser settings to block, delete, or restrict cookies if you prefer. Each browser has its own 
process for managing cookie preferences, which you can find in the browser’s help or settings 
section. 
 
Please note that disabling or blocking cookies may affect your experience on our Site and limit the 
functionality of certain features. 
 
 

5. Personal Data and Privacy 

In certain instances, the use of cookies may involve the collection and processing of personal data, 
such as your IP address or browsing behavior, which can be used to identify you directly or 
indirectly. Any processing of personal data through cookies is conducted strictly in accordance 
with our Privacy Policy. This Policy outlines in detail the types of personal data we collect, the 
purposes for which we use it, how we safeguard your information, and your rights regarding your 
personal data. We are committed to ensuring that any personal data processed via cookies is 
handled transparently, securely, and in full compliance with applicable data protection laws and 
regulations. 



 

6. Revoking Consent 

You may revoke your cookie consent at any time by deleting the cookies stored on your device or 
changing your browser settings. If consent is withdrawn, we will stop using the affected cookie 
types to collect further information, though data already collected may still be used in accordance 
with our Privacy Policy. 

 

7. Changes to This Cookie Policy 

We may update this Cookie Policy from time to time to reflect changes in law, technology, or our 
services. Any updates will be published on this page with the revised "Last Updated" date below. 

We recommend reviewing this Cookie Policy periodically to stay informed of how we use cookies. 
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